WAREHOUSE RUBBER P.V.C. HIP BOOTS AND KNEE BOOTS
YW15-0001
Vendor 1 Vendor 2 Vendor 3
Southeast Safety & Supply
ITEMNO. |QUANITY UNIT |ITEM DESCRIPTION Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
RUBBER HIP BOOTS AND KNEE BOOTS
1 20 PAIR | 31" BLACK HIP BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 6 CC# 80024301204 $70.45 $1,409.00|NO BID NO BID
2 20 PAIR | 31" BLACK HIP BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 7 CC# 80024301402 $70.45 $1,409.00
3 200 PAIR | 31" BLACK HIP BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 8 CC# 80024301600 $70.45 $14,090.00
4 250 PAIR | 31" BLACK HIP BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 9 CCi# 80024301808 $70.45 $17,612.50
5 250 PAIR | 31" BLACK HIP BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 10 CC# 80024302004 $70.45 $17,612.50
6 250 PAIR | 31" BLACK HIP BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 11 CC# 80024302202 $70.45 $17,612.50
7 250 PAIR | 31" BLACK HIP BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 12 CC# 80024302400 $70.45 $17,612.50
8 160 PAIR | 31" BLACK HIP BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 13 CC# 80024302608 $70.45 $11,272.00
9 50 PAIR | 31" BLACK HIP BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 14 CC# 80024302645 $70.45 $3,522.50
10 50 PAIR | 31" BLACK HIP BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 15 CC# 80024302739 $70.45 $3,522.50
1 6 PAIR | 31" BLACK HIP BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 16 CC# 80024303016 $124.25 $745.50
12 20 PAIR |16" BLACK KNEE BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 6 CC# 80024601009 $77.85 $1,557.00
13 20 PAIR [16" BLACK KNEE BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 7 CC# 80024601108 $77.85 $1,557.00
14 160 PAIR |16" BLACK KNEE BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 8 CC# 80024601207 $77.85 $12,456.00
15 160 PAIR [16" BLACK KNEE BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 9 CC# 80024601306 $77.85 $12,456.00
16 200 PAIR |16" BLACK KNEE BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 10 CC# 80024601405 $77.85 $15,570.00
17 200 PAIR |16" BLACK KNEE BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 11 CC# 80024601504 $77.85 $15,570.00
18 200 PAIR |16" BLACK KNEE BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 12 CC# 80024601603 $77.85 $15,570.00
19 160 PAIR |16" BLACK KNEE BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 13 CC# 80024601702 $77.85 $12,456.00
20 38 PAIR [16" BLACK KNEE BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 14 CC# 80024601801 $77.85 $2,958.30
21 37 PAIR |16" BLACK KNEE BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 15 CC# 80024601900 $77.85 $2,880.45
22 6 PAIR |16" BLACK KNEE BOOTS W/STEEL TOE SZ 16 CC# 80024602000 $91.45 $548.70
LUMP SUM TOTAL $199,999.95 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL LUMP SUM FOR COMPARISON $199,999.95 NO BID NO BID
|
—
(3

C:RUBBER P.V.C.BOOTS.TAB.2014




