WAREHOUSE FIRE EXTINGUISHERS SERVICE 3/21/2014
YW14-0004
Vendor 1 Vendor 2 _
Herbert S. Hiller Fire & Safety Commodities
ITEM# |QUANITY | UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
FIRE EXINGUISHERS SERVICE
1. 525 Each |Price To Visually Inspect Weigh & Re-Tag All Fire Extinguishers Semi-Annually $10.00 $5,250.00
Total Price $5,250.00 No Bid
2. Price for labor only to recharge ABC Dry Chemical Fire Ext. (Approx.133) Herbert S. Hiller Fire & Safety Commodities
a) 5 Each |One (1) 2-1/2 Ib. Extinguisher Re-charge $12.00 $60.00
b.) 40 Each |One (1) 5 Ib. Extinguisher Re-charge $12.00 $480.00
c) 50 Each |One (1) 10 Ib. Extinguisher Re-charge $15.00 $750.00
d.) 30 Each [One (1) 20 Ib. Extinguisher Re-charge $20.00 $600.00
e) 5 Each |One (1) 50 Ib. Extinguisher Re-charge $30.00 $150.00
f) 3 Each |One (1) 125 Ib. Extinguisher Re<charge $45.00 $135.00
Total Price (Items a. thru f. - Semi-Anually) $2,175.00 No Bid
3 Price For Labor Only To Rechare Carbon Dioxide Fire Ext. (Approx.145) Herbert S. Hiller Fire & Safety Commodities
a) 5 Each |One (1) 5 Ib. Extinguisher Re-charge $30.00 $150.00
b.) 30 Each |One (1) 10 Ib. Extinguisher Recharge $30.00 $900.00
c) 105 Each |One (1) 15 Ib. Extinguisher Re-charge $50.00 $5,250.00
d) 5 Each |One (1) 50 Ib. Extinguisher Re-charge $80.00 $400.00
Total Price (ltems a. thru d.) $6,700.00 No Bid
4. Price for Labor Only To Perform 6 yr. Operational Test ABC Dry Chemical Fire Ext. (Approx.41) Herbert S. Hiller Fire & Safety Commodities
a) 2 Each {One (1) 2-1/2 Ib. Extinguisher Operational Test $1.00 $2.00
b.) 10 Each |One (1) 5 Ib. Extinguisher Operation Test $27.00 $270.00
c.) 15 Each |One (1) 10 Ib. Extinguisher Operational Test $27.00 $405.00
d) 1 Each |One (1) 15 Ib. Extinguisher Operational Test $0.00 $0.00
e) 12 Each |One (1) 20 Ib. Extinguisher Operational Test $1.00 $12.00
f) 1 Each |One (1) 125 Ib. Extinguisher Operational Test $100.00 $100.00
Total Price (Items a. thru f.) $789.00 No Bid
5 Price for Labor Only To Perform 5 yr. Hydro. Test of Carbon Dioxide Fire Ext. (Approx.28) Herbert S. Hiller Fire & Safety Commodities
a) 1 Each |One (1) 5 Ib. Extinguisher Hydrostatic Test $1.00 $1.00
b.) 10 Each |One (1) 10 Ib. Extinguisher Hydrostatic Test $20.00 $200.00
c) 15 Each |One (1) 15 Ib. Extinguisher Hydrostatic Test $30.00 $450.00
d) 2 Each |One (1) 50 Ib. Extinguisher Hydrostatic Test $80.00 $160.00
Total Price (ftems a. thru d.) $811.00 No Bid
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WAREHOUSE FIRE EXTINGUISHERS SERVICE 3/21/2014
YW14-0004
Vendor 1 Vendor 2
Herbert S. Hiller Fire & Safety Commodities
ITEM# |QUANITY | UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
6. Price for Labor Only To Perform 12 yr. Hydrostatic Test on ABC Dry Chemical Fire Ext. (Approx.12)
a) 1 Each |One (1) 2-1/2 Ib. Extinguisher Hydrostatic Test $1.00 $1.00
b.) 2 Each |One (1) 5 Ib. Extinguisher Hydrostatic Test $1.00 $2.00
c.) 3 Each |[One (1) 10 Ib. Extinguisher Hydrostatic Test $1.00 $3.00
d) 1 Each |One (1) 15 Ib. Extinguisher Hydrostatic Test $45.00 $45.00
e) %) Each |Qne (1) 20 Ib. Extinguisher Hydrostatic Test $40.00 $120.00
f) 1 Each |One (1) 50 Ib. Extinguisher Hydrostatic Test $40.00 $40.00
g.) 1 Each |One (1) 125 Ib. Extinguisher Hydrostatic Test $60.00 $60.00
Total Price (items a. thru g.) $271.00 No Bid
Herbert S. Hiller Fire & Safety Commodities
7. 200 Each |Price for Labor and Materials used to Stencil (Number) Fire Ext. w/4" High Numbers/Letters $20.00 $4,000.00
8. 10 Each |Price To Provide Updated Summary List For All Locations 2 Times Semi-Annually $50.00 $500.00
9. Price To Fumnish New Fire Extinguishers To Various S&WB Facilities As Needed $20,000.00 $20,000.00
10. Price For Alt Extinguishing Agents & Repair Parts Needed For Extinguisher Repair $10,000.00 $10,000.00
Total Price (7 through 10) $34,500.00 No Bid
LUMP SUM TOTAL $50,496.00 No Bid
TOTAL LUMP SUM FOR COMPARISON OF PROPOSALS $50,496.00 No Bid

ACCOUNT CODE: 0850-WAREHOUSE & GROUNDS

FUND CODE: 030-REVOLVING

OBJECT CODE: 9916-MISCELLANEOUS

REQUISITION NO.: YW14-0004

ESTIMATED AMOUNT: §60,000.00

REMARKS: Emails were sent to several perspective bidders; one (1) proposal was received.

Bold dentes the actual winner.
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