WAREHOUSE FULL CIRCLE STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR AND TAP CLAMPS 10/19/2013
YW13-0099
Vendor 1 Vendor 2 Vendor 3 Vendor 4 Vendor 5
La. Utilities Supply Co. H.D. Supply Waterworks | Choice Supply Solutions Cimsco, Inc. PowerSeal
ITEM# |QUANITY | UNIT | SECTION I- FULL CIRCLE ALL STANLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMPS Unit Price  |Amount Unit Price |Amount Unit Price  |Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price  |Amount
1-1 25 Each |Power Seal Type 3121AS- 2.63 x 12" Full Circle 18-8 Type 304 CC# 67052170152 $44.90 $1,122.50 $44.00 $1,100.00 $48.60 $1,215.00 $43.44 $1,086.00|Bid Informal
1-2 250 Each |Power Seal Type 3122 AS-5.57 x 12" Fult Circle 18-8 Type 304 CC# 67052170163 $77.68]  $19,420.00 $84.50] $21,125.00 $88.20]  $22,050.00 $81.78 $20,445.00
1-3 25 Each |Power Seal Type 3122 AS - 5.57 x 20" Full Circle 18-8 Type 304 CC# 67052170174 $132.00 $3,300.00)  $136.00 $3,400.00 $142.00 $3,550.00 $130.00 $3,250.00
14 1000 Each |Power Seal Type 3122 AS-7.64 x 12" Full Circle 18-8 Type 304 CC# 67052170185 $95.00]  $95,000.00 $88.00 $88,000.00 $109.00] $109,000.00 $86.75 $86,750.00
1-5 75 Each |Power Seal Type 3122 AS -7.64 x 20" Full Circle 18-8 Type 304 CC# 67052170196 $139.00) $10,425.00f $140.00{ $10,500.00 $170.00]  $12,750.00 $138.00 $10,350.00
1-6 75 Each [Power Seal Type 3122 AS -9.79 X 12" Full Circle 18-8 Type 304 CC# 67052171005 $93.80 $7,035.00 $94.00 $7,050.00 $109.00 $8,175.00 $93.00 $6,975.00
1-7 25 Each |Power Seal Type 3122 AS - 9.79 x 20" Full Circle 18-8 Type 304 CC# 67052171120 $158.00 $3,950.00]  $162.00 $4,050.00 $192.00 $4,800.00 $160.00 $4,000.00
1-8 5 Each |Power Seal Type 3122 AS - 11.84 X 12" Full Circle 18-8 Type 304 CC# 67052171401 $109.00 $545.00]  $140.00 $700.00 $170.00 $850.00 $121.00 $605.00
1-9 5 Each |Power Seal Type 3122 AS -11.84 X 20 Full Circle 18-8 type 304 CC# 67052171502 $170.00 $850.00)  $193.00 $965.00 $235.00 $1,175.00 $180.00 $900.00
1-10 150 Each |Power Seal Type 3122 AS-13.95 X 12" Full Circle 18-8 Type 304 CC# 67052172001 $128.00f  $19,200.00] $159.00] $23,850.00 $190.00)]  $28,500.00 $155.00 $23,250.00
1-11 25 Each |Power Seal Type 3122 AS - 13.95 X 20" Full Circle 18-8 Type 304 CC# 67052172003 $183.00 $4,575.00]  $215.00 $5,375.00 $275.00 $6,875.00 $210.00 $5,250.00
1-12 50 Each |Power Seal Type 3122 AS - 14.51 x 12" Full Circle 18-8 Type 304 CC# 67052162191 $124.00 $6,200.00)  $159.00 $7,950.00 $190.00 $9,500.00 $156.00 $7,800.00
1-13 25 Each |Power Seal Type 3122 AS- 14.51 X 20" Full Circle 18-8 Type 304 CC# 67052162202 $183.00 $4,575.00]  $222.00 $5,550.00 $270.00 $6,750.00 $218.00 $5,450.00
1-14 20 Each |Power Seal Type 3122 AS - 14.34 X 12" Full Circle 18-8 Type 304 CC# 67052172005 $124.00 $2,480.00]  $159.00 $3,180.00 $220.00 $4,400.00 $156.00 $3,120.00
1-15 20 Each |Power Seal type 3122 AS Extended Range 14.34" X 20" CC# 67052172805 $222.00 $4,440.00)  $270.00 $5,400.00 $467.50 $9,350.00 $265.00 $5,300.00
1-16 10 Each |Power Seal Type 3122 A.S. - 17.90 Full Circle 18-8 Type 304 CC# 67052172213 $236.00 $2,360.00)  $370.00 $3,700.00 $486.00 $4,860.00 $370.00 $3,700.00
1-17 1 Each |Power Seal Type 3132 AS Extended Range-18.46" X 20" CC# 67052173258 $309.00 $300.00]  $497.00 $497.00 $761.00 $761.00 $490.00 $490.00
1-18 5 Each |Power Seal Type 3122 AS -19.98" X 30" Ful Circle 18-8 Type 304 CC# 67052173367 $253.00 $1,265.00]  $383.00 $1,915.00 $540.00 $2,700.00 $375.00 $1,875.00
1-19 5 Each |Power Seal Type 3122 AS- 22,06" X 20" Full Circle 18-8 Type 304 CC# 67052173523 $320.00 $1,600.00]  $574.00 $2,870.00 $825.00 $4,125.00 $562.00 $2,810.00
1-20 2 Each |Power Seal Type 3122 AS -22.27" x 30" Full Circle # 18-8 Repair Clamp CC# 67052173005 $250.00 $500.00]  $383.00 $766.00 $705.00 $1,410.00 $375.00 $750.00
1-21 1 Each |Power Seal Type 3122 AS 23.70" X 20" Full Circle #18-8 Type 304 CCi# 67052173007 $325.00 $325.00] $574.00 $574.00 $825.00 $825.00 $565.00 $565.00
1-22 6 Each |Power Seal type 3122 AS - 23.70" X 30" Full Circle #18-8 Repair Clamp CC# 67052173951 $359.00 $2,154.00]  $655.00 $3,930.00]  $1,125.00 $6,750.00 $540.00 $3,240.00
1-23 4 Each |Power Seal type 3122 AS- 26.40" X 30" Fuli Circle #18-8 Steel CC# 67052173955 $400.00 $1,600.00]  $903.00 $3,612.00]  $1,400.00 $5,600.00 $1,100.00 $4,400.00
1-24 4 Each |Power Seal Type 3121AS 32.00" X 30" Full Circle # 18-8 Steel CC# 67052174251 $527.00 $2,108.00)  $982.00 $3,928.00]  $1,835.00 $7,340.00 $1,300.00 $5,200.00
1-25 2 Each |Power Sel Type 3123 AS- 38.30" X 30" Full Circle # 18-8 Steel CC# 67052174301 $340.00 $680.00f $1,191.00 $2,382.00]  $2,150.00 $4,300.00 $1,675.00 $3,350.00
1-26 1 Each |Power Seal Type 3124 AS - 45.80" X 30" Full Circle # 18-8 Steel CC# 67052175423 $340.00 $340.00 $1,218.00 $1,218.00]  $2,025.00 $2,025.00 $1,675.00 $1,675.00
1-27 4 Each |Power Seal Type 3124 AS - 46.80" X 30" Full Circle #18-8 Steel CC# 67052176483 $600.00 $2,400.00| $1,370.00 $5,480.00]  $2,550.00  $10,200.00 $2,000.00 $8,000.00
Lump Sum Total For Section | $198,758.50 $219,067.00 $279,836.00 $220,586.00 Bid Informal
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WAREHOUSE

FULL CIRCLE STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR AND TAP CLAMPS 10/19/2013
YW13-0099
Vendor 1 [ Vendor 2 | Vendor 3 l Vendor 4 Vendor 5
La. Utilities Supply Co. H.D. Supply Waterworks | Choice Supply Solutions Cimsco, Inc. PowerSeal
ITEM# [QUANITY | UNIT SECTION Ii- FULL CIRCLE TAP CLAMPS Unit Price  |Amount Unit Price [Amount Unit Price  [Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price  |Amount
2-1 25 Each |Romac Type SS2 5.57 X 12" X 3/4" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052181103 $78.40 $1,960.00]  $100.00 $2,500.00 $103.40 $2,585.00] No Bid Bid Informal
22 25 Each |Romac Type SS2-5.57 X 12" X 1" AWW Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052181137 $78.40 $1,960.00]  $100.00 $2,500.00 $103.40 $2,585.00
2-3 25 Each |Romac Type $S2-5.57" X 12" X 1 1/2" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052181194 $90.00 $2,250.00]  $109.00 $2,725.00 $122.10 $3,052.50
24 25 Each [Romac Type §S2 5.57" X 12" X 2" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052181285 $90.00 $2,250.00]  $115.00 $2,875.00 $128.00 $3,200.00
2-5 200 Each [Romac Type $S2-7.64" X 12" X 3/4" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052182002 $96.00)1  $19,200.00 $94.00] $18,800.00 $115.00f  $23,000.00
26 100 Each |Romac Type SS-7.64" x 12" X 1 AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052182036 $96.00 $9,600.00)  $106.00] $10,600.00 $115.00]  $11,500.00
27 75 Each |Romac Type 582 7.64" X 12" X 1 1/2" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052182093 $103.00 $7,725.00]  $114.00 $8,550.00 $119.00 $8,925.00
2-8 50 Each |Romac Type $S2-7.64" X 12" X 2" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052182117 $103.00 $5,150.001  $125.00 $6,250.00 $130.00 $6,500.00
29 50 Each |Romac Type §S2-9.79"X 12" X 3/4" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052182655 $100.00 $5,000.00)1  $103.00 $5,150.00 $134.20 $6,710.00
2-10 25 Each |Romac Type $S29.79" X 12" X 1" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052182689 $102.00 $2,550.00)1  $124.00 $3,100.00 $134.20 $3,355.00
211 25 Each |Romac Type $S2-9.79" X 12" X 1 1/2" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC#67052182747 $109.00 $2,725.00]  $130.00 $3,250.00 $143.00 $3,575.00
212 25 Each |Romac Type $82-9.79" X 12" X2" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052182960 $109.00 $2,725.00)  $136.00 $3,400.00 $148.50 $3,712.50
213 25 Each |Romac Type SS2 13.95" X 12" X 3/4" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052183095 $120.00 $3,000.00]  $170.00 $4,250.00 $205.00 $5,125.00
2-14 50 Each [Romac Type SS2 - 13.95" X 12" X 1" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052183106 $122.00 $6,100.00]  $170.00 $8,500.00 $205.00]  $10,250.00
2-15 25 Each |Romac Type SS2 13.95" X 12" X 1 1/2" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052183117 $123.00 $3,075.00]  $180.00 $4,500.00 $213.40 $5,335.00
2-16 50 Each |Romac Type SS2- 13.95" X 12" X 2" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052183128 $123.00 $6,150.00]  $185.00 $9,250.00 $219.00]  $10,950.00
217 15 Each [Romac Type SS2- 14.51" X 12" X 3/4" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052162335 $120.00 $1,800.00]  $170.00 $2,550.00 $205.00 $3,075.00
2-18 5 Each |Romac Type SS2 14.51" X 12" X 1" AWWA Tapped Repair Clapm CC# 67052162483 $120.00 $600.00]  $170.00 $850.00 $205.00 $1,025.00
219 10 Each |Romac Type $S2- 14.51" X 12" X 1 1/2" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC#67052162509 $123.00 $1,230.00]  $180.00 $1,800.00 $215.00 $2,150.00
2-20 10 Each |Romac Type SS2 14.51' X 12" X 2" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052162681 $123.00 $1,230.00]  $185.00 $1,850.00 $220.00 $2,200.00
221 10 Each |Romac Type §S2 - 17.90" X 12" 1-1/2" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052183139 $144.00 $1.440.00]  $207.00 $2,070.00 $295.00 $2,950.00
2-22 10 Each |Romac Type $S2 17.90" X 12" X 2" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052183172 $144.00 $1,440.00]  $212.00 $2,120.00 $300.00 $3,000.00
2-23 5 Each |JCM Type 132 AS - 18.46" X 20" X 1 1/2" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052163457 $248.00 $1.240.00]  $343.00 $1,715.00 $565.00 $2,825.00
224 5 Each [JCM Type 132 AS - 18.46" X 20" X 2" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052163565 $248.00 $1,240.00]  $343.00 $1,715.00 $520.00 $2,600.00
2-25 5 Each [Romac Type $S2-22,27" X 20" X 1 1/2" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052183183 $128.00 $640.00]  $383.00 $1,915.00 $565.00 $2,825.00
2-26 5 Each [Romac Type §S2 22.27" X 20" X 2" Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052183194 $128.00 $640.00)  $383.00 $1,915.00 $570.00 $2,850.00
227 5 Each [Romac Type SS2- 26.40" X 20" X 1-1/2" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052183205 $320.00 $1,600.00]  $640.00 $3,200.00 $890.00 $4,450.00
2-28 5 Each |Romac Type SS2 - 26.40" X 20" X 2" AWWA Tapped Repair Clamp CC# 67052183216 $320.00 $1,600.00]  $640.00 $3,200.00 $890.00 $4,450.00
Lump Sum Total For Section Il $96,120.00 $121,100.00 $144,760.00 No Bid Bid Informal
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WAREHOQUSE FULL CIRCLE STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR AND TAP CLAMPS 10/19/2013
YW13-0099
Vendor1 | Vendor2 | Vendor3 | Vendor 4 Vendor 5
La. Utilities Supply Co. H.D. Supply Waterworks | Choice Supply Solutions Cimsoc, Inc. PowerSeal
ITEM# [QUANITY | UNIT SECTION lll- BRONZE SERVICE SADDLES Unit Price lAmount Unit Price |Amount Unit Price  [Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price  |Amount

La. Utilities Supply Co.

341 5 Each |Power Seal Style 3407-4"X 3/4" AWWA Clamp Pipes CC# 67052290001 $52.00 $260.00 $53.00 $265.00 $62.40 $312.00] No Bid Bid Informal|

32 10 Each |Power Seal Style 3407-4" X 1" AWWA Clamp Range Pipes CC# 67052290003 $52.00 $520.00 $53.00 $530.00 $62.40 $624.00

3-3 5 Each |Power Seal Style 3407- 4" x 1-1/2" AWWA Fiberglass Pipes CC# 67052290005 $82.00 $410.00 $61.00 $305.00 $97.90 $489.50

34 5 Each |Power Seal Style 3407- 4" X 2" AWWA Fiberglass Pipes CC# 67052290007 $82.00 $410.00 $61.00 $305.00 $97.90 $489.50

35 20 Each |Power Seal Style 3407- 6" x 3/4" AWWA Fiberglass Pipes CC# 67052290009 $80.00 $1,600.00 $67.00 $1,340.00 $95.70 $1,914.00

36 50 Each |Power Seal Style 3407 - 6" X 1" AWWA Fiberglass Pipes CC# 67052290011 $80.00 $4,000.00 $62.00 $3,100.00 $95.70 $4,785.00

37 Each [Power Seal Style 3407 -6" X 1-1/2" AWWA Fiberglass Pipe CC# 67052290013 $91.00 $455.00 $70.00 $350.00 $109.00 $545.00

3-8 Each |Power Seal Style 3407- 6" x 2" AWWA Fiberglass Pipes CC# 67052290015 $91.00 $455.00 $77.00 $385.00 $109.00 $545.00

39 5 Each |Power Seal Style 3407 8" X 3/4" AWWA Fiberglass Pipes CC# 67052290017 $89.00 $445.00 $76.00 $380.00 $107.00 $535.00

3-10 10 Each |Power Seal Style 3407- 8" X 1" AWWA Fiber glass Pipes CC# 67052290019 $89.00 $890.00 $76.00 $760.00 $107.00 $1,070.00

3-11 5 Each |Power Seal Style 3407 - 8" X 1-1/2" AWWA Fiberglass Pipes CC# 67052290021 $95.00 $475.00 $80.00 $400.00 $114.50 $572.50

312 5 Each |Power Seal Style 3407 - 8" X 2" AWWA Fiberglass Pipes CC# 67052290023 $99.00 $495.00 $87.00 $435.00 $119.50 $597.50

313 5 Each |Power Seal Style 3407-10" X 3/4" AWWA Fiberglass Pipes CC# 67052290025 $162.00 $810.00]  $475.00 $2,375.00 $197.00 $985.00

3-14 5 Each |Power Seal Style 3407 - 10" X 1" AWWA Fibergalss Pipes CC# 67052290027 $166.00 $830.00 $95.00 $475.00 $201.50 $1,007.50

315 5 Each |Power Seal Style 3407- 10" X 1-1/2" AWWA Fiberglass Pipes CC# 67052290029 $78.00 $390.00f  $104.00 $520.00 $186.50 $932.50

3-16 5 Each [Power Seal Style 3407- 10" X 2" AWWA Fibergalss Pipes CC# 67052290031 $170.00 $850.00f  $112.00 $560.00 $208.00 $1,040.00

317 10 Each [Power Seal Style 3407- 12" X 3/4" AWWA Fiberglass Pipes CC# 67052290033 $182.00 $1,820.00  $111.00 $1,110.00 $222.00 $2,220.00

318 25 Each |Power Seal Style 3407- 12" X 1" AWWA Fiberglass Pipes CC# 67052290035 $182.00 $4,550.001  $111.00 $2,775.00 $222.00 $5,550.00

319 10 Each |Power Seal Style 3407- 12" X 1-1/2" AWWA Fiberglass Pipes CC# 67052290037 $183.00 $1,830.00) $125.00 $1,250.00 $222.00 $2,220.00

3-20 10 Each |Power Seal Style 3407-12" X 2" AWWA Fiberglass Pipes CC# 67052290039 $183.00 $1,830.00]  $127.00 $1,270.00 $222.00 $2,220.00

3-21 5 Each |Power Seal Style 3407 -16" X 3/4" AWWA Fiberglass Pipes CC# 67052290041 $290.00 $1,450.00]  $202.00 $1,010.00 $350.00 $1,750.00

3-22 5 Each |Power Seal Style 3407- 16" X 1" AWWA Fiberglass Pipes CC# 67052290043 $290.00 $1,450.00]  $202.00 $1,010.00 $350.00 $1,750.00

3-23 5 Each [Power Seal Style 3407 - 16" X 1-1/2" AWWA Fiberglass Pipes CC# 67052290045 $300.00 $1,500.00]  $220.00 $1,100.00 $365.50 $1,827.50

3-24 5 Each [Power Seal Style 3407- 16" X 2" AWWA Fiberglass Pipes CC# 67052290047 $300.00 §1,500.00]  $220.00 $1,100.00 $365.50 $1,827.50

Lump Sum Total For Section Il $28,225.00 $23,110.00 $35,809.00 No Bid Bid Informal
Vendor 1 Vendor 2 Vendor 3 Vendor 4 Vendor 5
La. Utilities Supply Co. H.D. Supply Waterworks | Choice Supply Solutions Cimsco, Inc. PowerSeal
ITEM# |QUANITY | UNIT SECTION IV- TRANSTITIONAL COUPLINGS Unit Price Amount  |Unit Price |Amount Unit Price Amount  |Unit Price Amount  |Unit Price Amount

41 50 Each |Hymax Part# 2000-0768-260 6" Hymax Couplings w/Builtin Ring CC# 67052500165 $166.00 $8,300.00)  $179.01 $8,950.30 $140.00 $7,000.00 $177.00 $8,850.00 |Bid Informal

4-2 25 Each |Hymax Part# 2000-0984-260 8" Hymax Couplings w/Built in Ring CC# 67052500185 $188.00 $4,700.00 $202.00 $5,050.00 $205.40 $5,135.00 $198.00 $4,950.00

43 40 Each |Hymax Part# 2000-1366-260 12" Hymax Couplings w/Built in Ring CC# 67052500120 $189.00 $7,560.00 $307.00| $12,280.00 $312.00]  $12,480.00 $301.00 $12,040.00

44 40 Each |Hymax Part# 2000-1441-260 12" Hymax Couplings w/Built in Ring CC# 67052500195 $345.99  $13,839.60] $374.00) $14,960.00 $425.00]  $17,000.00 $369.00 $14,760.00

Lump Sum Total $34,399.60 $41,240.30 $41,615.00 $40,600.00 Bid Informal
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WAREHOUSE FULL CIRCLE STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR AND TAP CLAMPS 10/21/2013

YW13-0099

Vendor1 | Vendor2 | Vendor3 | Vendor 4 Vendor 5

La. Utilities Supply Co. H.D. Supply Waterworks  |Choice Supply Solutions Cimsco, Inc. PowerSeal

Unit Price Amount  |Unit Price Amount |Unit Price Amount  |Unit Price Amount  |Unit Price Amount
Lump Sum Total For Section | $198,758.50 $219,067.00 $279,836.00 $220,586.00 Bid Informal
Lump Sum Total For Section Il $96,120.00 $121,100.00 $144,760.00 No Bid Bid Informal
Lump Sum Total For Section lIl $29,225.00 $23,110.00 $35,809.00 No Bid Bid Informal
Lump Sum Total For Section IV $34,399.60 $41,240.30 $41,615.00 $40,600.00 Bid Informal
Lump Sum Total For Comparison Of Proposal $358,503.10 $404,517.30 $502,020.00 $261,186.00 Bid Informal

Remarks: La, Utilities Supply Co. has an error in the Lump Sum Total for Section | of $196.958.50;The corrected Total is $196,758.50,
H.D. Supply Waterworks has an error in Total Lump Sum for Section | of $219,068; The corrected Total is $219,067.00. Error inTotal Lump Sum for Secton Il of $21,390.00;The corrected Total is $23,110.00.
Cimsco, Inc. has an error in Total Lump Sum for Section | of $223,286.00; The corrected Toal is $220,586.00.
PowerSeal Bid is Informal; They didn't send in the complete Specification as stated on page 2

Bold denotes the actual winners. This contract shall be awarded Section by Section; La.Utilities Supply Co.shall be awarded Sections 1,11,& V. H.D. Supply Waterworks shall be awarded Section il.
Total amount awarded is $352.388.10
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