SEWERAGE & WATER BOARD OF NEW ORLEANS

TABULATION OF PROPOSALS RECE!IVED FOR FURNISHING

AEROSOL, JANITORIAL AND INDUSTRIAL CHEMICALS
CONTRACT PERIOD JUNE 1, 2013 THROUGH MAY 31, 2014
PROPOSAL OPENED THURSDAY APRIL 18, 2013

REQUISTION NO: YW13-0009

C: AEROSOL, JANITORIAL AND INDUSTRIAL CHEMICALS.Tab.2013



WAREHOUSE AEROSOL,JANITORIAL AND INDUSTRIAL CHEMICALS
YW13-0009
Vendor1 | Vendor 2
Assorted Products Wechem
ITEM NO. | QUANITY UNIT |ITEM DESCRIPTION Unit Price  |Amount Unit Price |Amount

1 1100 Gal | Mineral Spirits Solvents & Chemicals CC# 63090038403 $11.50] $12,650.00 No Bid
2 2000 Lbs | 400 Lb. Drum New Moblie Gear 600 XP 150 CC# 40543000150 $3.20 $6,400.00 No Bid
3 2000 Lbs | 400 Lb. Drum MobilGear 600 XP 220, Mobil Co. CC# 40549000220 $3.20 $6,400.00 No Bid
4 110 Gal | Super Flo ATF D/IM Exxon Co. (D&S) CC# 40536000347 $14.90 $1,639.00 No Bid
5 275 Gal | DTE 732, Exxon Co. (D&S) CC# 40557000032 $21.50 $5,912.50 No Bid
6 2200 Gal |Teresstic 68, Exxon Co. (D&S) CCH# 40557000068 $21.00] $46,200.00 No Bid
7 220 Gal |Teresstic 150, Exxon Co. (D&S) CC# 40557000150 $18.00f  $3,960.00 No Bid
8 165 Gal |Teresstic 220, Exxon Co. (D&S) CC# 40557000220 $20.00)  $3,300.00 No Bid
9 5 Pail |Unirex N2, Exxon Co. 35LB Pails(D&S) CC# 4052451002 $179.55 $897.75 No Bid
10 5 Pail |Unirex N3, Exxon Co. 35 LB. Pails (D&S) CC# 40524501033 $179.55 $897.75 No Bid
1 110 Gal |Exxon Co. 30 Weight Oil CC# 40539030239 $19.17 $2,108.70 No Bid
12 220 Gal |Exxon Febis K-68 CC# 40531034001 $21.50 $4,730.00 No Bid
13 110 Gal |Exxon Nuto H-68 CC# 40531034019 $13.00 $1,430.00 No Bid
14 55 Gal |Exxon Spinwesstic 10 CC# 40531034028 $19.00 $1,045.00 No Bid
15 55 Gal |Exxon Nuto 46 CC# 40531034037 $13.00 $715,00 No Bid
16 55 Gal |Exxon Febis H-32 CC# 40531034046 $19.00 $1,045.00 No Bid
17 165 Gal |Kerosene CC#40530200605 $9.60 $1,584.00 No Bid
18 1100 Gal |Amazing Concepts Nok-Out Multi Purpose Odor Eliminator CC# 88551000001 $17.50]  $19,250.00 No Bid
19 275 Gal |Degreaser Wechem Hulk System CC# 48518004514 $6.50 $1,787.50 No Bid
20 80 Gal |Degreaser Trans Gulf Teepot HD#PP80 CC# 48518243752 $4.40 $352.00 No Bid
21 1200 Cans |Alr Freshner Misty Baby Power 10.5 oz Assorted Scents CC# 48532072901 $6.25 $7.500.00 No Bid
22 1800 Cans |MistyFoamy All Purpose 200z. Cans Cleaner CC# 48518241103 $4.00 $7,200.00 No Bid
23 100 Gal |Cleaner Trans Gulf # 32 Lemon Germicidal Floor 5 Gallon Pails CC# 48518243965 $28.75 $2,875.00 No Bid
24 100 Gal |Trans Gulf Mean Green # 172 For Greasy Floors 5 Gallon Pails CC# 48518243852 $28.50 $2,850.00 No Bid
25 120 Cans |Drain Opener Trans- Gulf Thicker Flush & Clean Liquid 320z. Cans CC# 48522400010 $3.15 $378.00 No Bid
26 100 Gal |Trans-Gulf Hard Glo Wax # 5498 Non Buffing Floor CC# 48554369008 $12.65 $1,265.00 No Bid
27 80 Gal |Stripper Trans-Gulf No Amonia Wax # 5400 1 Gallon CC# 48555645912 $6.00 $480.00 No Bid
28 40 Gal |Stripper Trans-Gulf Wax # 5291 Ammoniated 1 Gallon CC# 48555650455 $10.00 $400.00 No Bid
29 40 Gal |Trans-Gulf Ind. Floor Wax Dura 1 Gallon CC# 48554369097 $9.15 $366.00 No Bid
30 20 Gal | Weed & Vegetation Killer, ABC Compounding MFG 1 Gallon CC# 67590000834 $75.00 $1,500.00 No Bid
31 300 Bottles| Cleaner Trans- Gulf 10% Phosphoric Acid Toilet Bowl CC# 4852630814 $2.75 $825.00 No Bid
32 1200 Cans | Insecticide, Ambush, Wechem Roach & Ant 120z CC# 48560652070 $5.75 $6.,900.00 No Bid
33 360 Cans | Lubricant Wechem CP2000, Anti-Seize Brush Top 10 oz Size CC# 40531023741 $12.00 $4,320.00 No Bid
34 60 Cans | Lubficant Wechem Win Coat Chain & Cable 140z CC# 40554155008 $10.00 $600.00 No Bid
35 60 Cans | Lubricant Wechem Dri-Molly High Temperature Sz 14 oz. CC# 40554153250 $10.00 $600.00 No Bid
36 1200 Cans | Lubricant Wechem infinity 8.5 oz Sz CC# 40554153369 $6.50 $7,800.00 No Bid
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WAREHOUSE AEROSOL,JANITORIAL AND INDUSTRIAL CHEMICALS
YW13-0009
Vendor1 | Vendor 2
Assorted Products Wechem
ITEM NO. |QUANITY UNIT |ITEM DESCRIPTION Unit Price |Amount Unit Price |Amount
37 500 Cans | Lubricant Trio Wechem 120z Sz. CC# 40554153478 $5.75 $2,875.00 No Bid
38 300 Cans | Oil Cutting Hydro Cut Wechem 120z. CC# 40548075389 $10.00 $3,000.00 No Bid
39 1500 Cans | Repellant Wechem Buzz Off 50z CC# 48560621371 $5.70 $8,550.00 No Bid
40 24 Cans | Lubricant Silcone Wechem 11 oz. CC# 07514180730 $4.90 $117.60 No Bid
41 1500 Cans | Solvent & Degreaser Wechem Force 100 180z CC# 48518244090 $5.95 $8,925.00 No Bid
42 1800 Cans | Wasp & Homet Killer, Zapper Wechem 19 oz. CC# 48560150158 $5.85| $10,530.00 No Bid
43 200 Gal | Cleaner Wechem Non Butly N.B.C. 1 Gallon CC# 48518362691 $8.00)  $1,600.00 No Bid
44 120 Gal | Car Wash, Wash & Wax Wechem 1 Gallon Sz. CC# 48536000001 $7.60 $912.00 No Bid
45 24 Cans | Cleaner and Polish, Wechem Brite Stanless Steel Sz 12 oz. CC# 48512000398 $9.10 $218.40 No Bid
46 275 Gal | Wechem 50-Bamel in the Box Solvent Degreaser Concentrate CC# 48518244900 $9.00 $2,475.00 No Bid
47 24 Cans | Mildew Stain Remover Wechem Mildex 100 Sizw 32. Oz CC# 48540430001 $6.50 $156.00 No Bid
48 50 Each | Lubricant Wechem No Grab Anti Seize Brush Top 8 0z CC# 40531023741 $16.00 $800.00 No Bid
49 75 Cans | Soap Wechem Workmen Hand W/Lanolin And Pumice CC# 45886800323 $18.45 $1,383.75 No Bid
50 180 Bottles| Soap Wechem Orange Grip 22 oz. Bottles CC# 48514360390 $8.30|  $1,494.00 No Bid
51 100 Gal | Solvent Wechem Excel 1 Galion Sz. CC# 19255004783 $39.57 $3,957.00 No Bid
52 100 Gal | Steamer Cleaner Wechem Red Baron 1 Gallon Sz. CC# 48534101505 $9.50 $950.00 No Bid
53 300 Cans | Disinfecent Deodorant Wechem Clean Scent, 200z Aerosol Can CC# 48540501617 $5.45 $1,635.00 No Bid
54 16 Pails |5 Gallons w/Dispencer Insecticide Spider CC# 67545001461 $114.00 $1,824.00 No Bid
55 300 Cans | Lubricant LPS3 Heavy Duty Rust InHibiter 11 oz CC# 40554390803 $12.00 $3,600.00 No Bid
56 250 Cans | Lubricant WD 40 Penetrating 9 oz. Wechem Infinity CC# 40554390902 $5.70 $1,425.00 No Bid
57 480 Cans | Insectcide MistyFlying Insect Killer #250 200z. CC# 48560651506 $6.95 $3,336.00 No Bid
58 100 Each | Wechem Mist Dispenser, Metered Battery Operated Dispenser CC# 48545008880 $25.50 $2,550.00 No Bid
59 150 Cans | Wechem Metered Mist Air Freshner Assorted Scents CC# 48532073245 $4.25 $637.50 No Bid
60 1400 Bottles| Cleaner Pureli Antiseptic Hand 40z CCi# 48586550500 $2.20 $3,080.00 No Bid
61 500 Bottles| Detergent Liquid Palmolive 32 oz. CC# 48516360712 $3.05|  $1,525.00 No Bid
62 1000 Bottles| Soap Dial Liquid Anti- Bacterial 16 oz, Bottles CC# 48586681023 $4.20 $4,200.00 No Bid
63 225 Bottles|Joy Liquid Detergent 32 oz CC# 48516360509 $5.40 $1,215.00 No Bid
64 40 Gal | Floor Soap M&L Industries 1 Galion Jugs CC# 48518363502 $12.00 $480.00 No Bid
65 40 Gal | Colgate Palmolive Liquid Soft Soap 1 Gallon Sz # CPC 1900 CC# 48586681789 $11.55 $462.00 No Bid
66 400 Cans | Cleaner Whisk Hand # W-2D 32 oz Can CC# 48514032241 $9.00 $3.600.00 No Bid
67 720 Bars | Soap Ivary Bath & Hand 4 1/2 oz CC# 48586401064 $0.84 $604.80 No Bid
68 1200 Bars | Soap Lava Hand w/ Pumice Professional Line 4.7 oz Bar CC# 48586400888 $0.95 $1,140.00 No Bid
69 200 Cans | Cleaner Go-Jo Hand Crean Type Antisceptic 18 oz Plastic Can CC# 48514360501 $3.00 $600.00 No Bid
70 200 Cans | Cleaner Comet Disinfectant W/ Chlorinol 21 oz. Can CCH# 48529101106 $1.50 $300.00 No Bid
71 120 Cans | Boraxo Powder Hand Soap120z. CC# 48586440355 $9.00 $1,080.00 No Bid
72 200 Gal | Wechem Formular One Clean-it neutral Cleaner 1-Gallon Size CC# 48518360762 $7.60 $1,520.00 No Bid
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‘NAREHOUSE AEROSOL,JANITORIAL AND INDUSTRIAL CHEMICALS
YW13-0009
Vendor1 | Vendor 2
Assorted Products Wechem
ITEM NO. | QUANITY UNIT |ITEM DESCRIPTION Unit Price  |[Amount Unit Price |Amount

73 200 Gal | Pine Oil 50% Pure Pine Oil 1 Gallon Size CC# 48542291207 $27.00)  $5,400.00 No Bid
74 600 Bottles| Bleach Regutar Strength Clorox 24 oz. CC# 50525011242 $1.40 $840.00 No Bid
75 500 Bottles| Bleach Industrials Strength Clorox 96 oz CC# 50525012596 $2.85 $1,425.00 No Bid
76 60 Gal | Al Purpose 409 Cleaner, 1- Gallon Sz CC# 48516305157 $9.80 $588.00 No Bid
77 100 Gal |Glass Windex Cleaner, | Gallon Size CC# 48528361615 $11.50 $1,150.00 No Bid
78 600 Cans |Glass Windex Cleaner, 20 oz Can CC# 48528361404 $4.05 $2,430.00 No Bid
79 1600 LBS | Oil Absorbant Oil-Dri Industrial Floor #06030 Sz. 40LB/Bag CC# 48574060001 $0.20 $320.00 No Bid
80 500 Each | New Pig Qil-Only Spill Pads # Mat 403 Sz Double Weight CC# 48574040001 $1.00 $500.00 No Bid
81 100 Cans | Dust Mop Treatment, Apollo 18 oz. CC# 48554323789 $8.00 $800.00 No Bid
82 100 Each | Gasket Silicone Wechem Super Seal White 30z. Tube CC# 81523720506 $6.00 $600.00 No Bid
83 100 Gal | Degreaser Snee Chemical Amazing Spray 1Gallon Size CC# 48518244114 $6.30 $630.00 No Bid
84 5000 LBS | Snee Sweeping Compound Oil Base CC# 4856101201 $0.54|  $2,700.00 No Bid
85 40 Each | Rubbermaid Mop Wringer Comb Cleaning Yellow Prod# 6129 CC# 48568003247 $70.00]  $2,800.00 No Bid
86 50 Each | Dust Pans Rubbermaid Dust Pan w/Long Handle 5-3/4 x12 x 36 5/8 CC# 48534400001 $16.80 $840.00 No Bid
87 200 Each | Spray Bottles 320z. Disp Trigger Adjust to Mist or Stream Spray CC# 48508653002 $1.70 $340.00 No Bid
88 72 Each | Brush Rubbermaid Proline Bow! Brush w/Metal Ferule Bru#6217 CC# 48510300010 $4.25 $306.00 No Bid
89 120 Quart | Scoops Consolidated Plastic 3 Quart Solid Scoop Prod # 50880LH Soild CC# 16552000101 $7.50 $900.00 No Bid
90 36 Each | Lagasse Foilaflex Piunger W/20 Wooden Handle 4" High 6" Dia CC# 67015001700 $6.00 $216.00 No Bid
91 1100 Gal | Wechem Master Concentrate Disinfectant CC# 88576491201 $8.75 $9,625.00 No Bid

LUMP SUM TOTAL $283,331.25 No Bid

TOTAL LUMP SUMI FOR COMPARISON $283,331.25 No Bid

Account Code: 0850 - Warehouse

Fund Code: 030 - Revolving

Obiject Code: 9916 - Miscellaneous

Requisition No: YW13-0009

Estimated Amount: $350,000.00

Remarks:Emails were sent out to two (2) perspesctive bidders; one (1) bid package was received.

*Bold denotes the actual winner.
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