WAREHOUSE IRON CASTING
YW15-0036
Vendor 1 Vendor 2
EJ USA, [nc.

ITEM# |QUANITY | UNIT |ITEM DESCRIPTION Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
1 5 Each |Lare Valve Manhole Frames and Covers Complete Edison Type CC#8903038001 $2,302.92 $11,514.60
2 5 Each |Manhole Covers Large Valve Manho! Frames Edison Type CC# 89030300001 $884.20 $4,421.00
3 25 Each |Flaring Straight Manhole Frames CompW/Covers Marked Water CC#89030380003 $319.04 $7,976.00
4 25 Each |Manhole Covers Only Marked "Water" CC# 89030300003 $101.34 $2,533.50
5 45 Each |FlaringStraight Manhole Frames CompW Cover Marked Sewer CC# 89030380005 $319.04 $14,356.80
6 45 Each |Manhole Covers only Marked Sewer CC# 89030300005 $101.34 $4,560.30
7 75 Each |Extension Valve Boxes w Covers But WO Telescopes CC# 89040301001 $218.95 $16,421.25
8 50 Each |Covers for Extension Valve Boxes CC# 89040535001 $22.13 $1,106.50
9 25 Each |Extension Valve Boxes W/Covers Marked WO/Telescopes CC# 89040301003 $218.95 $5,473.75
10 5 Each |Special 3"X4" Manholes Frames & Covers Complete CC# 890303800007 No Bid $0.00
1 5 Each |Covers Only for Special 3"x4" Manhole for Pipe Lines & Canal CC# 83030300007 No Bid $0.00
12 25 Each |Flaring & Straight Manhole Frames Cover comp Marked Drain CC#89030380009 $319.04 $7,976.00
13 25 Each |Manhole Covers Only Marked Drain CC# 89030300009 $101.34 $2,533.50
14 25 Each |Catch Basin Covers Only CC# 21007240001 $320.44 $8,011.00
15 25 Each |No.1 Standard Catch Basins Intakes Only CC# 210007240003 $331.48 $8,287.00
16 25 Each |No. 2 Standard Catch Basins Intake Only CC# 21007240005 $405.45 $10,136.25
17 10 Each |No. 3 Standard Catch Basins Intakes Only CC # 21007240007 $440.71 $4,407.10
18 5 Each |No. 4 Standard Catch Basins Intakes Only CC# 21007240009 No Bid $0.00
19 5 Each |No. 5 Standard Catch Basins Intakes Only CC# 21007240011 $421.02 $2,105.10
20 50 Each |Standard Catch Basins Frames Only CC# 21007240013 $147.70 $7,385.00
21 20 Each |Cleanout for House Drains CC# 89030380011 $263.36 $5,267.20
22 5 Each |Manhole Frames & Covers for Nashville Ave. Canal Comp CC# 89030380013 No Bid $0.00
23 5 Each |Covers Only for Nashville Ave. Canal CC# 89030300011 No Bid $0.00
24 5 Each |Ring & Cover Type Manholes for Canal& Pipe Lines Comp CC# 89030630001 $221.64 $1,108.20

25 10 Each |Standard Manhole Grating Covers CC# 89030300013 $128.90 $1,289.00
26 5 Each |Manhole Frames Covers for Perm Bench Marks CC# 83030380015 No Bid $0.00
27 15 Each |24"x30" Clear Opening Catch Basins and Manholes Complete CC# 21007240017 $738.82 $11,082.30
28 10 Each [24"x30" Clear Opening Catch Basin Covers Only CC# 21007240019 $370.88 $3,708.80
29 25 Each |Catch Basin For Lip Or Drive Over Curb Single Type Complete CC# 21007240021 $486.63 $12,165.75
30 25 Each |Covers Only for Single Type Lip or Drive Curb Catch Basins CC# 21007240023 $222.15 $5,553.75
31 5 Each [Catch Basins for Lip Or Dive Curb Double Type Comp CC# 21007240025 $1,192.84 $5,964.20
32 5 Each |Covers Only For Double Type Lip Or Drive Catch Basins CC# 210072440027 $694.22 $3,471.10
33 50 Each |Sewer Clean-Out Box Complete w/Covrs Marked Sewer CC#89030380017 $37.81 $1,890.50
34 20 Each |Clean -Out Covers Only Marked Sewer CC# 89030280001 $18.44 $368.80
35 75 Each |25 1/2 X 37 1/2 S&WB ManholeCast & Cover Comp MK PowerCCi# 83030380019 $1,032.57 $77,442.75
36 25 Each |Covers Only For S&WB Manhole Marked Power CC# 89030300015 $441.07 $11,026.75
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37 5 Each |Special Fabricated Steel Cover for Canal Clean Out Manhole CC# 89030300017 No Bid $0.00
38 5 Each |Frames for Special Clean-Out Manhole for Lined & CovCanals CC#89030400001 No Bid $0.00
39 10 Each |Special Manhole Frames Cover & Cover Comp Marked SewerCC¥# 89030380021 No Bid $0.00
40 5 Each |Covers Only for Special Manhole Marked Sewer CC# 89030300019 No Bid $0.00
41 150 Each |Manhole Riser Ring Cast Iron 2° Dimensions CC# 8903064201 $116.79 $17,518.50
LUMP SUM TOTAL $277,062.25
TOTAL LUMP SUM FOR COMPARISON $277,062.25
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