WAREHOUSE HOSES AND ACCESSORIES
YW15-0008
Vendor 1 Vendor 2 Vendor 3
Atlas Hose & Gasket Co. Covington Sales JGB Enterprises Inc.
ITEM NO. |QUANITY | UNIT |ITEM DESCRIPTION Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price  |Amount
SECTION 1 - AIR HOSE, COUPLINGS, CLAMPS AND WASHERS DUNNAGE BAGS
ITEM NOS. 1-1 THRU 1-11
11 50 Each |3/4" X 50' AIR HOSE (CC# 46010431750) $55.19]  $2,759.50 $96.00]  $4,800.00 $57.92 $2,896.00
1-2 8 Bags |of 50 Each 3/4" CHICAGO COUPLING WASHERS (CC# 46010881004) $14.00 $112.00 $22.00 $176.00 $14.00 $112.00
13 10 Each |3/4" CHICAGO MALE COUPLINGS (CC# 46010591750) $1.87 $18.70 $3.85 $38.50 $3.75 $37.50
14 10 Each |3/4" CHICAGO FEMALE COUPLINGS (CC# 46010591537} $1.58 $15.80 $3.50 $35.00 $3.72 $37.20
1-5 100 Each |S/S HEX HEAD SCREW WORM DRIVE HOSE CLAMP FITS 3/8"-5/8" (CC# 4603507826) $0.65 $65.00 $1.40 $140.00 $0.70 $70.00
1-6 10 Each |5/8"-3/4" HOSE CLAMPS (CC# 46035047837) $0.65 $6.50 $1.40 $14.00 $0.92 $9.20
1-7 20 Each [3/4" X 500" HIGH PRESSURE HOSE (CC# 46090401191) $1,411.36]  $28,227.20 $1,785.00] $35,700.00] $1,194.12 $23,882.40
1-8 10 Each [1/2" X 500' HIGH PRESSURE HOSE (CC# 46090401080) $1,487.06| $14,870.60 $1,370.00| $13,700.00 $852.95 $8,529.50
19 250 FEET |FEET 1/2" AIR HOSE (CCi# 46010431230) $0.52 $130.00 $1.20 $300.00 $3.36 $840.00
1-10 4 Each |4'X4' RUBBER DUNNAGE BAG (CC# 08526018744) $753.75 $3,015.00 $1,170.75|  $4,683.00 $8.00 $32.00
1-11 4 Each |5' X 9' DUNNAGE BAG (CC# 08526018768) $1,761.25 $7,045.00 $2,682.00f $10,728.00 $29.95 $119.80
LUMP SUM TOTAL $56,265.30 $70,314.50 $36,565.60
Vendor 1 Vendor 2 Vendor 3
ITEM NO. | QUANITY | UNIT [SECTION I! - WATER AND FIRE HOSE, WASHERS, GASKETS, HYDRANT SPANNER Atlas Hose & Gasket Co. Covington Sales JGB Enterprices Inc.
WRENCH, HOSE AND ADPTORS & NOZZLES Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price  |Amount
ITEM NOS. 2-1 THRU 2-21
2-1 50 Each |3/4" X 50' RUBBER GARDEN HOSE (CC# 46030651205) $47.36 $2,368.00 $88.00|  $4,400.00 $44.35 $2,217.50
2-2 5 Each |STES 3/4" GARDEN HOSE REPAIR COUPLINGS (CC# 46035195257) $6.27 $31.35 $10.50 $52.50 $6.26 $31.30
2-2A 5 Each [SETS 1" RUBBER WATER REPAIR COUPLINGS (CC# 46035195379) $15.72 $78.60 $24.60 $123.00 $16.68 $83.40
2-3 1 BAG | 100 PER BAG 3/4" GARDEN HOSE WASHER (CC# 46035884561) $4.40 $4.40 $7.80 $7.80 $10.00 $10.00
24 50 Each [LENGTHS 1" X 50" RUBBER WATER HOSE {CC# 46030651394) $7469]  $3,734.50 $145.001  $7,250.00 $79.48 $3,974.00
25 1 BAG |100 PER BAG 1" WATER HOSE WASHERS {CC# 46035884801) $5.25 $5.25 $8.80 $8.80 $65.00 $65.00
26 25 Each |LENGTHS 2-1/2" X 50' FIRE HOSE (CC# 34056013591) $274.00]  $6,850.00 $450.00) $11,250.00|NO BID $0.00
2-7 100 Each |2-1/2' FIRE HOSE WASHER (CC# 46038107383) $0.80 $80.00 $1.50 $150.00|{NO BID $0.00
28 10 Each |HYDRANT SPANNER (CC# 34060871356) $17.41 $174.10 $29.90 $299.00 $37.95 $379.50
29 20 Each |3/4™ X 2-1/2 BRASS MOON ADAPTER (CC# 34012012899) $42.97 $859.40 $69.00]  $1,380.00|NO BID $0.00
2-10 20 Each |1" X2-1/2" BRASS MOON ADAPTER (CC# 34012012908) $42.97 $859.40 $69.00]  $1,380.00|NO BID $0.00
2-11 10 Each |2-1/2" X 2-1/2" DOUBLE MALE ADAPTER (CC# 34012013017) $46.67 $466.70 $74.00 $740.00|NO BID $0.00
2-12 5 Each |2-1/2' X 2-1/2" DOUBLE FEMALE ADAPTER (CC# 34012013126) $70.67 $353.35 $110.00 $550.00|NO BID $0.00
2-13 5 Each [2-1/2" X 2" BRASS MOON ADAPTER (CC# 34012013235) $40.67 $203.35 $66.00 $330.00|NO BID $0.00
2-14 40 Sets |3/4" BRASS GARDEN HOSE NOZZLE (CC# 46035521007) $4.85 $194.00 $10.80 $432.00 $81.97 $3,278.80
2-15 10 Each |BRASS ADAPTER 3/4" FEMALE GHT X 1" FEMALE NPSM (CC# 46035047948) $12.64 $126.40 $22.00 $220.00 $3.19 $31.90
2-16 10 Each |BRASS ADAPTER 3/4" FEMALE GHT X 1" MALE NPSM (CC# 46035049759) $17.83 $178.30 $30.00 $300.00 $6.37 $63.70
2-17 20 Each |1" BRASS HOSE NOZZLE (CC# 46035528408} $10.15 $203.00 $18.50 $370.00 $21.29 $425.80
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2-18 10 Each |2-1/2" BRASS FIRE HOSE NOZZLE (CC# 34064101750) $98.87 $988.70 $155.00)  $1,550.00|NO BID $0.00
2-19 10 Each [2-1/2" MOON ADAPTER FEMALE SWB X MALE NPSM (CC# 34012013500) $47.33 $473.30 $75.00 $750.00|NO BID $0.00
2-20 10 Each |3/4" MALE GHT X 4" FEMAL NPT (CC# 46035047963) $3.00 $30.00 $7.00 $70.00 $3.55 $35.50
2-21 10 Each |BRASS ADAPTER 3/4" FEMALE GHT X 3/4" MALE NPT (CC# 46035047972) $3.87 $38.70 $8.90 $89.00 $4.57 $45.70
LUMP SUM TOTAL $18,300.80 $31,702.10 $10,642.10
Vendor 1 Vendor 2 Vendor 3
ITEM NO. | QUANITY | UNIT [SECTION Il -- SUCTION/DISCHARGE HOSE, SPANNERS, STRAINERS, CAM & Atlas Hose & Gasket Co. Covington Sales JGB Enterprises Inc.
GROOVE ADAPTERS/COUPLERS Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price  |Amount
ITEM NOS. 3-1 THRU 3-44

31 5 Each |1-1/2" x 20' RUBBER SUCTION HOSE (cc# 46085461658) $92.71 $463.55 $179.00 $895.00 $53.20 $266.00
32 25 Each |1-1/2" SUCTION HOSE WASHER (CC# 45038123489) $0.40 $10.00 $0.75 $18.75 $0.38 $9.50
33 5 Each |2" X 20' RUBBER SUCTION HOSE (CC# 46085462300) $104.25 $521.25 $198.00 $990.00 $60.95 $304.75
34 5 Each |2" x 20' POLY SUCTION HOSE (CC# 46085462607) $65.11 $325.55 $139.00 $695.00 $60.95 $304.75
35 15 Each |2" X 100' DISCHARGE HOSE, PLASTIC (CC# 46085444700) $53.33 $799.95 $121.00] $1,815.00 $376.28 $5,644.20
36 15 Each |3' X 25" RUBBER SUCTION HOSE (CC# 46085463555) $201.25 $3,018.75 $340.00]  $5,100.00 $118.42 $1,776.30
37 75 Each |3" X 25' POLY SUCTION HOSE (CCi# 46085463631) $143.76] $10,782.00 $252.00] $18,900.00 $118.42 $8,881.50
38 40 Each |3" X 100' DISCHARGE HOSE PLASTIC (CC# 46085444730)) $91.03 $3,641.20 $184.00]  $7,360.00 $437.63 $17,505.20
39 5 Each |4" X 25' RUBBER SUCTION HOSE (CC# 46085463852) $258.51 $1,292.55 $430.00]  $2,150.00 $169.52 $847.60
310 10 Each |4" X 25' POLY SUCTION HOSE (CCi# 46085464960) $241.07 $2,410.70 $402.00]  $4,020.00 $169.52 $1,695.20
31 15 Each |4" X 100' DISCHARGE HOSE, PLASTIC (CCi# 46085444693) $131.40 $1,971.00 $249.00)  $3,735.00 $761.92 $11,428.80
312 6 Each [6" X 25' RUBBER SUCTION HOSE (CC# 46085463860} $438.48 $2,630.88 $710.00{  $4,260.00 $326.51 $1,959.06
3413 6 Each [6" X 25" POLY SUCTION HOSE (CC# 46085466076) $450.48 $2,702.88 $718.00|  $4,308.00 $326.51 $1,959.06
3-14 10 Each |6" X 50' DISCHARGE HOSE, PLASTIC (CC# 46085444560) $181.99 $1,819.90 $360.001  $3,600.00 $687.64 $6,876.40
315 25 Each [2' CAM & GROOVE AB200 FEMALE COUPLING X MALE NPT (CC# 46085381403) $4.95 $123.75 $9.00 $225.00 $19.48 $487.00
3-16 60 Each |3' CAM & GROOVE FEMALE COUPLER X MALE NPT (CCit 46085381414) $8.60 $516.00 $14.90 $894.00 $33.11 $1,986.60
317 15 Each |4" CAM & GROOVE FEMALE COUPLER X MALE NPT (CC# 46085381425) $12.09 $181.35 $21.00 $315.00 $46.20 $693.00
3-18 5 Each |1-1/2" CAM & GROOVE 150 A MALE ADAPTER X FEMALE NPT (CCi# 46085381436) $1.80 $9.00 $4.00 $20.00 $1.87 $9.35
3-1¢ 25 Each |2" CAM & GROOVE 200A MALE ADAPTER X FEMALE NPT. (CC# 46085381447) $2.31 $57.75 $6.00 $150.00 $2.25 $56.25
320 20 Each |3" CAM & GROOVE 300 A MALE ADAPTER X FEMALE NPT (CC# 46085381458) $3.73 $74.60 $9.00 $180.00 $3.70 $74.00
3-21 10 Each |4" CAM & GROOVE 400A MALE ADAPTER X FEMALE NPT (CC# 46085381469) $6.60 $66.00 $13.00 $130.00 $6.39 $63.90
322 5 Each [1-1/2" CAM & GROOVE 150F MALE ADAPTER X MALE NPT (CC# 46085381480) $2.53 $12.65 $7.00 $35.00 $2.45 $12.25
3-23 15 Each [2' CAM & GROOVE 200F MALE ADAPTER X MALE NPT { CC# 46085381491) $2.89 $43.35 $7.00 $105.00 $3.00 $45.00
3-24 15 Each [3" CAM & GOROVE 300F MALE ADAPTER X MALE NPT (CC# 46085381502) $5.67 $85.05 $11.00 $165.00 $5.75 $86.25
3-25 10 Each |4" CAM & GROOVE 400F MALE ADAPTER MALE NPT (CC#46085381513) $8.51 $85.10 $16.00 $160.00 $10.28 $102.80
3-26 15 Each |1-1/2" CAM & GROOVE AD150 FEMALE COUPLING X FEMALE NPT(CC# 46085381524) $4.87 $73.05 $11.00 $165.00 $4.82 $72.30
327 15 Each [2" CAM & GROOVE AD200 FEMALE COUPLING X FEMALE NPT. (CC# 46085381535) $5.23 $78.45 $12.00 $180.00 $4.95 $74.25
3-28 15 Each |3" CAM & GROOVE AD300 COUPLING X FEMALE NPT (CC# 46085381546) $8.64 $129.60 $16.00 $240.00 $9.38 $140.70
3-29 15 Each [4" CAM & GROOVE AD400 COUPLING X FEMALE NPT (CC# 46085381557) $13.04 $195.60 $23.00 $345.00 $13.53 $202.95
3-30 10 Each [1-1/2" CAM & GROOVE COUPLING WASHERS (CC# 46038145289) $0.50 $5.00 $1.15 $11.50 $0.39 $3.90
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3-31 10 Each |2" CAM & GROOVE COUPLIN WASHERS (CCi# 46038145291) $0.55 $5.50 $1.50 $15.00 $0.39 $3.90
332 10 Each |3" CAM & GROOVE COUPLING WASHERS (CC# 46038145283) $0.60 $6.00 $1.80 $18.00 $0.45 $4.50
333 50 Each |4" CAM & GROOVE COUPLING WAHSERS (CC# 46038145305} $0.80 $40.00 $2.25 $112.50 $0.58 $29.00
334 10 Each [1-1/2" SUCTION HOSE STRAINER, RH. (CC# 46085407435) $4.88 $48.80 $10.00 $100.00 $4.89 $48.90
3-35 25 Each [2" SUCTION HOSE STRAINER,RH. (CC# 46085407513) $6.16 $154.00 $12.50 $312.50 $7.68 $192.00
3-36 60 Each |3" SUCTION HOSE STRAINER, RH. (CC# 46085407602) $8.40 $504.00 $16.50 $990.00 $10.48 $628.80
337 10 Each |4" SUCTION HOSE STRAINER, RH. (CC# 46085407697) $9.52 $95.20 $18.00 $180.00 $11.88 $118.80
3-38 35 Each |2" SUCTION HOSE STRAINER, SH. (CC# 46085408813) $5.75 $201.25 $12.00 $420.00 $7.17 $250.95
3-39 65 Each |3" SUCTION HOSE STRAINER, SH. (CC# 46085408902) $8.80 $572.00 $17.00]  $1,105.00 $10.98 $713.70
340 10 Each [4" SUCTION HOSE STRAINER, SH. {CC# 46085408997) $9.87 $98.70 $19.00 $190.00 $12.33 $123.30
341 10 Each [1-1/2" HOSE SPANNER (CC# 44591351502) $1.69 $16.90 $7.00 $70.00 $10.87 $108.70
342 10 Each |2" HOSE SPANNER (CC# 44591352003) $2.04 $20.40 $9.00 $90.00 $10.87 $108.70
343 10 Each |3"HOSE SPANNER (CC# 44591353005) $3.71 $37.10 $11.00 $110.00 $10.87 $108.70
344 10 Each |4" HOSE SPANNER (CC# 44591354000) $4.73 $47.30 $13.00 $130.00 $19.00 $190.00

LUMP SUM TOTAL $35,973.61 $65,010.25 $66,198.77

Vendor 1 Vendor 2 Vendor 3
ITEM# | QUANITY | UNIT |SECTION IV - SHEET PACKING, O" RINGS, RUBBBER & FIBER WASHER Atlas Hose & Gasket Covington Sales JGB Enterprises Inc.
ITEM NOS. 4-1 THRU 4-45 Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price  |Amount

4-1 200 FT [(6 ROLLS) 1/8" RED RUBBER GASKET SHEET PACKING 36" WIDE (CC# 81554041023) $4.20 $840.00 $10.00|  $2,000.00 $190.56 $1,143.36
42 300 FT |(2ROLLS) 1/16" VELLUMOID SHEET PACKING 36" WIDE (CC# 81554039060) $2.57 $771.00 $7.60|  $2,280.00 $11.99 $3,597.00
4-3 150 FT [(2 ROLLS) 1/32 VELLUMOID SHEETPCKING 36" WIDE (CC# 81554039034) $1.23 $184.50 $5.35 $802.50 $5.76 $864.00
44 60 FT [(1ROLL) 1/64" VELLUMOID SHEET PACKING 36" WIDE (CC# 81554039012} $0.71 $42.60 $2.00 $120.00 $4.69 $281.40
45 500 Each |M7A 4" O-RING FOR STUFFING BOX NUT (CC# 81545013001) $0.20 $100.00 $0.89 $445.00|NO BID $0.00
46 50 Each |M7A 5" O-RING FOR STUFFING BOX NUT (CC# 81545013012) $0.20 $10.00 $0.89 $44.50|NO BID $0.00
47 200 Each |M7A 4" O-RING FOR STUFFING BOX NUT (CC# 81545013023) $0.20 $40.00 $0.90 $180.00|NO BID $0.00
4-8 50 Each |M7A 5' O-RING FOR STUFFIN BOX NUT (CC# 81545013034) $0.20 $10.00 $0.90 $45.00|NO BID $0.00
49 50 Each |AMERICAN DARLING HYDRANT SEAT O-RING, (CC# 81545013045) $28.00]  $1,400.00 $44.00|  $2,200.00|NOBID $0.00
4-10 50 Each [AMERICAN DARLING HYDRANT SEAT O-RING, (CC# 81545013056) $19.33 $966.50 $31.00]  $1,550.00|NO BID $0.00
4-11 15000 | Each [5/8” METER BOX WSHER (CC# 28535012581) $0.15 $2,250.00 $0.50|  $7,500.00|NO BID $0.00
4-12 450 Each |O-RING FOR S&WB FIRE HYDRANT, #413 (CC# 81545013067) $0.50 $225.00 $0.99 $445.50|NO BID $0.00
413 450 Each [O-RING FOR S&WB FIRE HYDRANT, #412 (CC# 81545013078) $0.50 $225.00 $0.99 $445.50|NO BID $0.00
4-14 10000 | Each |3/4 METER BOX WASHER (CC# 28535012675) $0.15 $1,500.00 $0.50|  $5,000.00{NO BID $0.00
4-15 5500 Each |1" METER BOX WASHER (CC# 28535012700) $0.18 $990.00 $0.60|  $3,300.00|NO BID $0.00
4-16 500 Each [M-16 CYLINDER SEAT GASKET 4" (CC# 34060500072) $0.70 $350.00 $1.35 $675.00|NO BID $0.00
417 1000 Each |M32 ELBOW GASKET 5" (CC# 34060500190) $4.80 $4,800.00 $9.00|  $9,000.00|NO BID $0.00
4-18 1000 Each |M-32 ELBOW GASKET 4" (CC# 34060500188) $7.23 $7,230.00 $13.00| $13,000.00|NO BID $0.00
4-19 500 Each [4" R.D. WOOD VALVE PACKING GLAND WASHER (CC# 67058982904) $0.20 $100.00 $0.50 $250.00|NO BID $0.00
4-20 500 Each [6" R.D. WOOD VALVE PACKING GLAND WASHER (CC# 67058982916) $0.25 $125.00 $0.60 $300.00|NO BID $0.00
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4-21 500 Each |8" R.D. WOOD VALVE PACKING GLAND WASHER (CC# 67058982928) $0.30 $150.00 $0.70 $350.00|NO BID $0.00
4-22 500 Each |12* R.D. WOOD VALVE PACKING GLAND WASHER (CC# 67058982940) $0.35 $175.00 $0.85 $425.00|NOBID $0.00
4-23 1000 | Each |M-1 HEAD GASKET 5' (CC# 34060500104) $0.93 $930.00 $1.99]  $1,990.00{NO BID $0.00
4-24 1000 | Each |M-1 HEAD GASKET 4" (CC# 34060500102) $0.85 $850.00 $1.90]  $1,900.00|NO BID $0.00
4-25 300 Each |M-28 MAIN VALVE WASHER 4" (CC# 34060500162) $18.44|  $5,532.00 $32.00]  $9,600.00|NO BID $0.00
4-26 300 Each |M-28 MAIN VALVE WASHER 5" (CC# 34060500164) $22.12|  $6,636.00 $38.00| $11,400.00|NOBID $0.00
4-27 200 Each {4" M-35 LOCK & CAP NUT GASKET (CC# 34060500206) $0.80 $160.00 $2.40 $480.00|NO BID $0.00
4-28 200 Each |5" M-35 LOCK & CAP NUT GASKET (CC# 34060500208} $0.85 $170.00 $2.60 $520.00{NO BID $0.00
4-29 40 LBS |1/4" GARLOCK PACKING (CC# 81552072502) $29.28| $1,171.20 $48.00]  $1,920.00 $91.27 $3,650.80
4-30 40 LBS |5/16" GARLOCK PACKING (CC# 81552072511) $29.28] $1,171.20 $48.001  $1,920.00 $78.68 $3,147.20
4-31 40 LBS |3/8” GARLOCK PACKING (CC# 81552072520) $29.28|  $1,171.20 $48.00]  $1,920.00 $75.83 $3,033.20
4-32 30 LBS |1/2" GARLOCK PACKING (CC# 81552072539) $29.28 $878.40 $48.00]  $1,440.00 $75.83 $2,274.90
4-33 10 LBS |[5/8" GARLOCK PACKING (CC# 81552072548) $29.28 $292.80 $48.00 $480.00 $75.83 $758.30
4-34 10 LBS |7/8" GARLOCK PACKING (CC# 81552072557) $29.28 $292.80 $48.00 $480.00 $75.83 $758.30
4-35 100 LBS |1/4" RED ROUGE PACKING (CC# 81552072600) $23.18]  $2,318.00 $39.00]  $3,900.00|NO BID $0.00
4-36 100 LBS |[5/16" RED ROUGE PACKING (CC# 81552072603) $23.18]  $2,318.00 $39.00{  $3,300.00|NO BID $0.00
4-37 100 LBS |3/8" RED ROUGE PACKING (CC# 81552072606) $23.18]  $2,318.00 $39.00]  $3,900.00|NO BID $0.00
4-38 100 LBS |[1/2" RED ROUGE PACKING (CC# 81552072609) $19.00{  $1,900.00 $33.00]  $3,300.00|NO BID $0.00
4-39 100 LBS |5/8" RED ROUGE PACKING (CC# 81552072612) $19.00]  $1,900.00 33|  $3,300.00|NOBID $0.00
440 100 LBS |7/8" RED ROUGE PACKING (CCH 81552072615) $19.00]  $1,900.00 $33.00]  $3,300.00|NO BID $0.00
4-41 1000 LBS [5/8" FIBER CORPORATION COCK WASHERS (CC# 67058851672) $0.30 $300.00 $0.95 $950.00|NO BID $0.00
4-42 2000 | Each |3/4" FIBER CORPORATION COCK (CC# 67058851684) $0.34 $680.00 $1.00]  $2,000.00{NO BID $0.00
443 1000 | Each |1" FIBER CORPORATION COCK WASHERS {CC# 67058851696) $0.80 $800.00 $1.75|  $1,750.00|NO BID $0.00
4-44 1000 | Each [1-1/2" FIBER CORPORATION COCK WASHERS (CC# 67058851708) $1.00)  $1,000.00 $2.00  $2,000.00|NO BID $0.00
445 1000 | Each |2" FIBER CORPORATION COCK WASHERS (CC# 67058851720) $1.10]  $1,100.00 $2.10]  $2,100.00|NO BID $0.00

LUMP SUM TOTAL $58,274.20 $114,808.00 $19,508.46
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Vendor1 | Vendor2 | Vendor3 |

Atlas Hose & Gasket Co. Covington Sales JGB Enterprises Inc.
SUBTOTAL FOR SECTION | $56,265.30 $70,314.50 $36,565.60
SUBTOTAL FOR SECTION If $18,300.80 $31,702.10 $10,642.10
SUBTOTAL FOR SECTION Iit $35,973.61 $65,010.25 $66,198.77
SUBTOTAL FOR SECTION IV $58,274.20 $114,808.00 $19,508.46
LUMP SUM TOTAL FOR COMPARISON OF PROPOSALS $168,813.91 $281,834.85 $132,788.30

REMARKS: Emails were sent cut to several perspective bidders; three (3) bid packages were received.

This contract shall be awarded to one (1) vendor bidding on all items in Section | through IV with the lowest lump sum total and fumishing products as specified or approved equals.

Bold denotes the actual winner. JGB Enterprises Inc. is the lowest bidder but they didn't bid on all items in each section. The second

lowest bidder is Atlas Hose & Gasket Co.
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